
Sarah Woolworth, 22, has 
been a patient at the  
Barrow Cleft and Cra-
niofacial Center since 
birth. Just like the main 
character in the best-sell-
ing novel Wonder, Sarah 
was born with Treach-
er Collins Syndrome. 
She’s had more doctors’ 
appointments than she 
can count, including 
four major surgeries, and 
more than a dozen minor 
surgeries.

A college student who 
volunteers at Barrow to 
help teach about the 
book and is studying to 
become a teacher, Sarah 
says, “There’s nothing 
more normal than being 
different, which is a good 
thing. If we were all the 
same, the world would be 
boring.”
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